
 
Telephone No. 2:4622495 
Telegraphic Address: 
Commercial : AIRCIVIL 
                      NEW DELHI 
Aeronautical : VIDDYAYX 
E Mail: dri@dgca.nic.in 
Fax : 01124629221 

 
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

AERONAUTICAL INFORMATION 
SERVICES 

DIRECTOR GENERAL OF CIVIL 
AVIATION 

OPPOSITE SAFDARJUNG AIRPORT 
NEW DELHI-110 003 

 
 

AIC 
Sl. No.   7  /2005 
 
 
            29  June,2005 

 
 
 

File No 9/7/2005 - IR 
    
     

 
The G.S.R. No.400 (E) published in the Gazette of India Extraordinary dated 16th 

June, 2005 is reproduced below for the information and guidance. 
 
 
 
 
 
            (Satendra Singh) 
 
     DIRECTOR GENERAL OF CIVIL AVIATION 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION   
     

N O T I F I C A T I O N 
 

New Delhi, the 14th June, 2005 
 
G.S.R. 400 (E).-- In exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 of the Aircraft Act, 
1934 (22 of 1934), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to 
amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937,namely:- 

 
1.   (1) These rules may be called the Aircraft  (2nd Amendment) Rules, 2005. 
 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.  
 

2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937, in Schedule II, Section J, paragraph 1, -- 
 

(i)     in clause (e), for the words “two hundred  fifty hours”, the words “two 
hundred hours” shall be substituted; 



 
(ii) in sub-clause (i), for the words “one hundred fifty hours”, the words “one 

hundred hours” shall be substituted; 
 
(iii)  in sub-clause (ii), for the words “twenty five  hours”, the words “twenty 

hours” shall be substituted. 
 
 
 

 
[F. No A.V.11012/07/2005-A]                                                         

 
                   RAGHU MENON, Joint Secretary  
 
Note:-- 
 
1. The principal rules were published in the Official Gazette vide notification 
number V-26, dated the 23rd March, 1937 and last amended by G.S.R. 330(E) dated the 
20TH May,2005 published in the  Extraordinary’ Part II, section (3), sub-section (i) of the 
Gazette of India. 
 
2. The Central Government in exercise of the powers conferred by proviso to section 
14 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of 1934) has in the public interest dispensed with the 
condition of previous publication in case of this notification vide its Order No. 
AV.11012/7/2005-A dated 14-6-2005.2005 issued in the  Ministry of Civil Aviation. 
 
 
 


